Tabulation of Bids

Runway 17-35 Reconstruction
Newton City-County Airport

FAA AIP Project Number 3-20-0058-29

Bid Opening: April 26, 2012, 3:30pm

Engineer's Estimate Dondlinger & Son TTK Construction LaFarge
Bid Item | FAA Spec]item Description [ Quantity  Units Unit Price] Extension Unit Price] Extension|  Unit Price] Extension Unit Price] Extension
BASE BID
1 P-100-1 |Mobilization LS 1 $644,270.00f $644,270.00| $307,000.00| $307,000.00| $390,000.00| $390,000.00| $850,000.00| $850,000.00
2 P-101-1 |ACP Milling (1.5" - 8") SY 79,903 $4.75| $379,539.25 $2.30| $183,776.90 $3.25| $259,684.75 $3.00| $239,709.00
3 P-101-2 |10" PCC Pavement Removal SY 98,069 $7.50] $735,517.50 $6.00( $588,414.00 $4.70] $460,924.30 $13.00( $1,274,897.00
4 P-101-3 |Pavement Marking Removal SF 19,276 $0.70 $13,493.20 $0.57 $10,987.32 $0.61 $11,758.36 $0.60 $11,565.60
5 P-101-4 |Cleaning Abandoned PCCP LS 1 $6,500.00 $6,500.00| $15,000.00 $15,000.00| $13,981.22 $13,981.22| $50,000.00 $50,000.00
6 P-102-1 |Maintenance of Traffic LS 1 $110,000.00{ $110,000.00| $137,000.00| $137,000.00| $85,000.00 $85,000.00| $140,000.00| $140,000.00
7 P-156-1 |Silt Fence LF 1,447 $3.00 $4,341.00 $1.10 $1,591.70 $3.20 $4,630.40 $1.20 $1,736.40
8 P-403-1 |Temporary Asphalt Pavement Ton 567 $105.00 $59,535.00 $115.00 $65,205.00 $159.75 $90,578.25 $110.00 $62,370.00
9 P-620-1 |Permanent Pavement Marking SF 131,265 $1.50] $196,897.50 $0.73 $95,823.45 $0.78| $102,386.70 $1.00| $131,265.00
10 P-620-2 |Temporary Pavement Marking SF 38,226 $1.00 $38,226.00 $0.35 $13,379.10 $0.37 $14,143.62 $0.50 $19,113.00
11 D-701-1 [19"x30" HERCP, Class V LF 1,635 $95.00( $155,325.00 $90.00( $147,150.00 $96.00| $156,960.00 $100.00| $163,500.00
12 D-701-2 [19"x30" HERCP End Section, Class V EA 6 $2,500.00 $15,000.00 $1,800.00 $10,800.00 $2,000.00 $12,000.00 $2,000.00 $12,000.00
13 D-701-3 [24" RCP Removal, Salvage, and Stockpile LF 1,600 $5.00 $8,000.00 $2.00 $3,200.00 $2.25 $3,600.00 $3.00 $4,800.00
14 D-703-1 [Riprap Ton 75 $55.00 $4,125.00 $45.00 $3,375.00 $48.21 $3,615.75 $50.00 $3,750.00
15 D-705-1 [4" Perforated PVC Underdrain LF 13,675 $15.00{ $205,125.00 $10.00( $136,750.00 $10.65| $145,638.75 $11.00f $150,425.00
16 D-705-2 [4" Non-Perforated PVC Underdrain LF 2,349 $18.00 $42,282.00 $4.00 $9,396.00 $4.50 $10,570.50 $4.50 $10,570.50
17 D-705-3 [Underdrain Cleanout, In Pavement EA 32 $650.00 $20,800.00 $600.00 $19,200.00 $640.00 $20,480.00 $675.00 $21,600.00
18 D-705-4 [Concrete Splash Block EA 6 $550.00 $3,300.00 $250.00 $1,500.00 $266.00 $1,596.00 $275.00 $1,650.00
19 D-751-1 [8'-2" x 5'-2" Manhole EA 2 $8,000.00 $16,000.00 $6,000.00 $12,000.00 $6,400.00 $12,800.00 $7,000.00 $14,000.00
20 D-751-2 [4'-2" x 5'-2" Manhole EA 2 $5,000.00 $10,000.00 $4,500.00 $9,000.00 $4,800.00 $9,600.00 $5,000.00 $10,000.00
21 T-901-1 [Seeding AC 9 $650.00 $5,850.00 $8.50 $76.50 $1,000.00 $9,000.00 $900.00 $8,100.00
22 T-908-1 [Mulching AC 9 $700.00 $6,300.00 $325.00 $2,925.00 $1,100.00 $9,900.00 $375.00 $3,375.00
#8, 5KV, 7-Strand, Type L-824C Cable, Installed in
23 L-108-1 Duct Bank or Conduit LF 1,215 $2.00 $2,430.00 $3.00 $3,645.00 $3.20 $3,888.00 $3.30 $4,009.50
24 L-108-2 |#6, Bare Counterpoise Wire, Installed in Trench LF 638 $1.90 $1,212.20 $3.00 $1,914.00 $3.20 $2,041.60 $3.30 $2,105.40
25 L-110-1 [2" Schedule 40 PVC Conduit, In Earth LF 203 $7.50 $1,522.50 $6.00 $1,218.00 $6.00 $1,218.00 $6.60 $1,339.80
26 L-110-2 [2" Schedule 40 PVC Conduit, Concrete Encased LF 130 $26.50 $3,445.00 $18.00 $2,340.00 $20.00 $2,600.00 $20.00 $2,600.00
27 L-110-3 [2-Way 2" PVC Duct Bank LF 270 $33.00 $8,910.00 $20.00 $5,400.00 $21.00 $5,670.00 $22.00 $5,940.00
Remove, Clean, Reinstall and Relamp Existing L-
28 L-125-1 |861T, Taxiway Edge Light, Lamp 120/6.6 Amp. EA 16 $150.00 $2,400.00 $140.00 $2,240.00 $150.00 $2,400.00 $155.00 $2,480.00
45 watt Quartz
Remove, Clean, Reinstall and Relamp Existing L-862,
29 L-125-2 |Runway Edge Light, Lamp 120/6.6 Amp. 120 watt EA 76 $150.00 $11,400.00 $140.00 $10,640.00 $150.00 $11,400.00 $155.00 $11,780.00
Quartz
Remove, Clean, Reinstall and Relamp Existing
30 L-125-3 [L-862E, Runway Edge Light, Lamp 120/6.6 Amp. EA 8 $150.00 $1,200.00 $140.00 $1,120.00 $150.00 $1,200.00 $155.00 $1,240.00
120 watt Quartz
31 L-125-4 [Threshold Light Bar, Complete-In-Place EA 2 $4,055.00 $8,110.00 $4,000.00 $8,000.00 $4,300.00 $8,600.00 $4,500.00 $9,000.00
32 L-125-5 [L-867 Light Base Extension, Height Varies EA 78 $250.00 $19,500.00 $600.00 $46,800.00 $640.00 $49,920.00 $675.00 $52,650.00
TOTAL BASE BID $2,740,556.15 $1,856,866.97 $1,917,786.20 $3,277,571.20
BID ALTERNATE 1 - Asphalt Runway, Asphalt Shoulders
1 [ P-152-1 [unclassifed Excavation [ cy [ 9919 $5.50]  $54,554.50] $0.00 #REF! #REF!




2 P-152-2 |Embankment in Place CcY 595 $4.50 $2,677.50 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
3 P-155-1 |9" Lime Treated Subgrade SY 82,425 $7.35| $605,823.75 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
4 P-155-3 |[Lime Ton 2,142 $165.00| $353,430.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
5 P-159-1 |Geotextile Fabric SY 97,290 $2.00[ $194,580.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
6 P-209M-1 | 12" Crushed Aggregate Base Course SY 35,065 $18.50| $648,702.50 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Recycled Concrete Aggregate Base Course . .
7 P-219M-1 (12" nominal thickness) SY 63,061 $12.50| $788,262.50 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00
8 P-401-1 |Bituminous Base Course Ton 32,602 $75.00| $2,445,150.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
9 P-401-2 |Bituminous Surface Course Ton 9,280 $85.00( $788,800.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
10 P-403-1 |4" Bituminous Shoulder Surface Course Ton 4,357 $65.00( $283,205.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
11 P-602-1 |Bituminous Prime Coat Gal 49,508 $3.50] $173,278.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
12 P-603-1 |Bituminous Tack Coat Gal 26,607 $3.75 $99,776.25 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
13 P-621-1 [Saw-Cut Grooving SY 62,249 $1.75| $108,935.75 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
TOTAL BID ALTERNATE 1 $6,547,175.75 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
BID ALTERNATE 2 - Concrete Runway, Asphalt Shoulders
1 P-152-1 [Unclassified Excavation CY 2,100 $6.50 $13,650.00 $2.50 $5,250.00 $5.00 $10,500.00 $24.00 $50,400.00
2 P-152-2 |[Embankment in Place CY 9,013 $2.50 $22,532.50 $6.00 $54,078.00 $4.00 $36,052.00 $5.00 $45,065.00
3 P-152-3 [Borrow Excavation CY 6,914 $15.00| $103,710.00 $6.50 $44,941.00 $9.00 $62,226.00 $15.00| $103,710.00
4 P-155-1 [9" Lime Treated Subgrade SY 82,425 $7.35| $605,823.75 $3.75| $309,093.75 $2.50 $206,062.50 $5.00] $412,125.00
5 P-155-3 |[Lime Ton 2,142 $165.00| $353,430.00 $175.00| $374,850.00 $160.00| $342,720.00 $215.00| $460,530.00
6 P-159-1 |Geotextile Fabric SY 97,290 $2.00( $194,580.00 $1.50| $145,935.00 $1.65[ $160,528.50 $2.50| $243,225.00
Recycled Concrete Aggregate Base Course

7 P-219M-2 (6" nominal thickness) SY 98,126 $7.00] $686,882.00 $2.50| $245,315.00 $5.00( $490,630.00 $4.00] $392,504.00
8 P-401-1 |Bituminous Base Course Ton 347 $77.50 $26,892.50 $115.00 $39,905.00 $159.75 $55,433.25 $115.00 $39,905.00
9 P-401-2 |Bituminous Surface Course Ton 261 $95.00 $24,795.00 $120.00 $31,320.00 $159.75 $41,694.75 $120.00 $31,320.00
10 P-403-1 |4" Bituminous Shoulder Surface Course Ton 4,523 $60.00| $271,380.00 $100.00| $452,300.00 $159.75| $722,549.25 $110.00| $497,530.00
11 P-501-1 |9" Portland Cement Concrete Pavement SY 77,812 $53.00| $4,124,036.00 $35.00( $2,723,420.00 $39.50| $3,073,574.00 $37.50| $2,917,950.00
12 P-602 |Bituminous Prime Coat Gal 10,490 $3.50 $36,715.00 $3.50 $36,715.00 $5.33 $55,911.70 $3.50 $36,715.00
13 P-603-1 |Bituminous Tack Coat Gal 3,032 $3.75 $11,370.00 $3.50 $10,612.00 $5.33 $16,160.56 $3.50 $10,612.00
14 P-621-1 [Saw-Cut Grooving SY 62,249 $1.75[ $108,935.75 $1.25 $77,811.25 $1.33 $82,791.17 $1.20 $74,698.80
TOTAL BID ALTERNATE 2 $6,584,732.50 $4,551,546.00 $5,356,833.68 $5,316,289.80

BASE BID + BID ALTERNATE 1 $9,287,731.90| NO BID| NO BID No Bid

BASE BID + BID ALTERNATE 2

$9,325,288.65|

$6,408,412.97|

$7,274,619.88

$8,593,861.00




