
South Kansas Avenue Reconstruction 

Project No. 11ST000007 (413)

City of Newton, Kansas

Bid Opening 8/2/2012  10:00 am

BID PLAN

ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT UNIT PRICE EXTENSION UNIT PRICE EXTENSION UNIT PRICE EXTENSION UNIT PRICE EXTENSION UNIT PRICE EXTENSION 

1 Contractor Construction Staking 1 LS $12,000.00 $12,000.00 $9,062.18 $9,062.18 $10,200.00 $10,200.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00

2 Field Office and Laboratory (Type A) 1 EACH $4,400.00 $4,400.00 $3,275.93 $3,275.93 $6,500.00 $6,500.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00

3 Foundation Stabilization (Set Price) 1 CY $43.49 $43.49 $43.49 $43.49 $43.49 $43.49 $43.49 $43.49 $43.49 $43.49

4 Mobilization 1 LS $62,000.00 $62,000.00 $131,678.40 $131,678.40 $115,200.00 $115,200.00 $175,000.00 $175,000.00 $150,000.00 $150,000.00

5 Removal of Existing Structures 1 LS $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $6,806.08 $6,806.08 $6,250.00 $6,250.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00

6 Rock Excavation 6,269 CY $7.00 $43,883.00 $10.80 $67,705.20 $19.00 $119,111.00 $18.00 $112,842.00 $13.50 $84,631.50

7 Water (Grading) (Set) 1 MGAL $35.00 $35.00 $35.00 $35.00 $35.00 $35.00 $35.00 $35.00 $35.00 $35.00

8 Curb & Gutter, Combined (AE) 823 FT $20.00 $16,460.00 $17.22 $14,172.06 $14.85 $12,221.55 $19.00 $15,637.00 $20.00 $16,460.00

9 Slope Drain (Concrete) 65 LN FT $55.00 $3,575.00 $19.53 $1,269.45 $65.00 $4,225.00 $90.00 $5,850.00 $80.00 $5,200.00

10 Sidewalk Construction (4”) 54 SY $27.00 $1,458.00 $21.95 $1,185.30 $45.00 $2,430.00 $33.00 $1,782.00 $50.00 $2,700.00

11 Concrete Pavers 34 SY $80.00 $2,720.00 $55.91 $1,900.94 $140.00 $4,760.00 $88.00 $2,992.00 $124.00 $4,216.00

12 Temporary Surfacing Material (Aggregate) (Set Price) 1 CY $35.00 $35.00 $35.00 $35.00 $35.00 $35.00 $35.00 $35.00 $35.00 $35.00

13 Temporary Surfacing Material (HMA) (Set Price) 1 TON $125.00 $125.00 $125.00 $125.00 $125.00 $125.00 $125.00 $125.00 $125.00 $125.00

14 Concrete Pavement (8” Uniform) (AE) 20,445 SY $45.00 $920,025.00 $31.42 $642,381.90 $41.50 $848,467.50 $39.00 $797,355.00 $47.00 $960,915.00

15 Adjustment of Water Meters 1 EACH $375.00 $375.00 $331.88 $331.88 $350.00 $350.00 $750.00 $750.00 $500.00 $500.00

16 Adjustment of Manholes 2 EACH $800.00 $1,600.00 $388.87 $777.74 $750.00 $1,500.00 $1,200.00 $2,400.00 $850.00 $1,700.00

17 Guardrail, Steel Plate 175 LN FT $28.00 $4,900.00 $64.59 $11,303.25 $67.00 $11,725.00 $56.10 $9,817.50 $56.10 $9,817.50

18 Temporary Erosion & Pollution Control 1 LS $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $6,766.58 $6,766.58 $5,950.00 $5,950.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $4,900.00 $4,900.00

19 Seeding 1 LS $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $4,261.51 $4,261.51 $3,250.00 $3,250.00 $2,700.00 $2,700.00 $2,600.00 $2,600.00

20 Pavement Marking (Multi-Component) (White) (4”) 4,113 FT $1.40 $5,758.20 $1.03 $4,236.39 $1.10 $4,524.30 $0.90 $3,701.70 $0.90 $3,701.70

21 Pavement Marking (Multi-Component) (White) (6”) 2,479 FT $0.60 $1,487.40 $1.55 $3,842.45 $1.50 $3,718.50 $1.35 $3,346.65 $1.35 $3,346.65

22 Pavement Marking (Multi-Component) (Yellow) (4”) 2,119 FT $0.50 $1,059.50 $1.03 $2,182.57 $1.10 $2,330.90 $0.90 $1,907.10 $0.90 $1,907.10

23 Pavement Marking (Intersection Grade) (White) (24”) 234 FT $13.10 $3,065.40 $4.01 $938.34 $4.00 $936.00 $3.50 $819.00 $3.50 $819.00

24

Pavement Marking Symbol (Intersection Grade) (White) 

(Right Turn Arrow) 6 EACH $235.00 $1,410.00 $200.69 $1,204.14 $200.00 $1,200.00 $175.00 $1,050.00 $175.00 $1,050.00

25

Pavement Marking Symbol (Intersection Grade) (White) 

(Left Arrow) 13 EACH $293.00 $3,809.00 $200.69 $2,608.97 $200.00 $2,600.00 $175.00 $2,275.00 $175.00 $2,275.00

26 Work Zone Signs (0 to 9.25 Sq. Ft.) 2,461 EACH PER DAY $0.20 $492.20 $0.11 $270.71 $0.25 $615.25 $0.10 $246.10 $0.10 $246.10

27 Work Zone Signs (9.26 to 16.25 Sq. Ft.) 4,173 EACH PER DAY $0.25 $1,043.25 $0.17 $709.41 $0.25 $1,043.25 $0.15 $625.95 $0.15 $625.95

28 Work Zone Barricades (Type III – 4’ to 12’) 6,420 EACH PER DAY $0.40 $2,568.00 $0.52 $3,338.40 $0.55 $3,531.00 $0.45 $2,889.00 $0.45 $2,889.00

29 Channelizer (Fixed) 5,350 EACH PER DAY $0.10 $535.00 $0.29 $1,551.50 $0.40 $2,140.00 $0.25 $1,337.50 $0.25 $1,337.50

30 Channelizer (Portable) 16,050 EACH PER DAY $0.15 $2,407.50 $0.11 $1,765.50 $0.15 $2,407.50 $0.10 $1,605.00 $0.10 $1,605.00

31 Work Zone Warning Light (Type “A” Low Intensity) 3,745 EACH PER DAY $0.25 $936.25 $0.57 $2,134.65 $0.75 $2,808.75 $0.50 $1,872.50 $0.50 $1,872.50

32 Arrow Display 214 EACH PER DAY $6.50 $1,391.00 $5.73 $1,226.22 $7.00 $1,498.00 $5.00 $1,070.00 $5.00 $1,070.00

33 Pavement Marking (Temporary) 4” Solid (Type I Tape) 102 STA/LINE $81.20 $8,282.40 $107.80 $10,995.60 $105.00 $10,710.00 $94.00 $9,588.00 $94.00 $9,588.00

34 Pavement Marking (Temporary) 4” Solid (Type II Tape) 82 STA/LINE $57.00 $4,674.00 $63.07 $5,171.74 $65.00 $5,330.00 $55.00 $4,510.00 $55.00 $4,510.00

35

Pavement Marking (Temporary) 4” Broken (3.3’) (Type I 

Tape) 3 STA/LINE $10.00 $30.00 $63.07 $189.21 $65.00 $195.00 $55.00 $165.00 $55.00 $165.00

36 Pavement Marking Removal 2,000 LN FT $0.40 $800.00 $0.46 $920.00 $0.75 $1,500.00 $0.40 $800.00 $0.40 $800.00

37 Common Excavation (Alt. 1) 503 CY $6.00 $3,018.00 $13.59 $6,835.77 $11.00 $5,533.00 No Bid #VALUE! $15.00 $7,545.00

38 Common Excavation (Contractor Furnished) (Alt. 1) 1,800 CY $6.00 $10,800.00 $17.56 $31,608.00 $9.00 $16,200.00 No Bid #VALUE! $15.00 $27,000.00

39 Compaction of Earthwork (Type B) (MR-90) (Alt. 1) 242 CY $1.00 $242.00 $1.74 $421.08 $4.50 $1,089.00 No Bid #VALUE! $0.75 $181.50

40 Compaction of Earthwork (Type AA) (MR-0-5) (Alt. 1) 7,238 CY $1.00 $7,238.00 $4.95 $35,828.10 $3.75 $27,142.50 No Bid #VALUE! $1.50 $10,857.00

41 Fly Ash (Alt. 1) 806 TON $43.72 $35,238.32 $94.84 $76,441.04 $55.00 $44,330.00 No Bid #VALUE! $55.00 $44,330.00

42 Manipulation for Treated Subgrade (6”) (Alt. 1) 21,714 SY $1.84 $39,953.76 $5.15 $111,827.10 $1.95 $42,342.30 No Bid #VALUE! $4.00 $86,856.00

43 Common Excavation (Alt. 2) 2,279 CY $6.00 $13,674.00 $9.58 $21,832.82 $11.25 $25,638.75 No Bid #VALUE! $15.00 $34,185.00

44 Compaction of Earthwork (Type B) (MR-90) (Alt. 2) 242 CY $1.00 $242.00 $1.63 $394.46 $4.25 $1,028.50 No Bid #VALUE! $0.75 $181.50

45 Compaction of Earthwork (Type AA) (MR-0-5) (Alt. 2) 3,619 CY $1.00 $3,619.00 $1.93 $6,984.67 $3.50 $12,666.50 No Bid #VALUE! $1.50 $5,428.50

46 6" AB-3 Base (Alt. 2) 21714 SY $10.00 $217,140.00 $9.46 $205,414.44 $9.00 $195,426.00 No Bid #VALUE! $12.00 $260,568.00

47 Common Excavation (Alt. 3) 2,279 CY $6.00 $13,674.00 $8.09 $18,437.11 $11.25 $25,638.75 $16.00 $36,464.00 $15.00 $34,185.00

48 Compaction of Earthwork (Type B) (MR-90) (Alt. 3) 242 CY $1.00 $242.00 $1.38 $333.96 $4.25 $1,028.50 $1.00 $242.00 $0.75 $181.50

49 Compaction of Earthwork (Type AA) (MR-0-5) (Alt. 3) 3,619 CY $1.00 $3,619.00 $1.63 $5,898.97 $3.50 $12,666.50 $2.00 $7,238.00 $1.50 $5,428.50

50 6" Crushed Concrete Base (Alt. 3) 21714 SY $5.50 $119,427.00 $7.42 $161,117.88 $7.75 $168,283.50 $10.00 $217,140.00 $10.00 $217,140.00

Base Bid Subtotal $1,159,383.59 $946,402.69 $1,199,466.99 $1,210,172.49 $1,306,686.99

Alternate 1 Bid Fly Ash $96,490.08 $262,961.09 $136,636.80 No Bid $176,769.50

Base Bid + Alternate 1 $1,255,873.67 $1,209,363.78 $1,336,103.79 No Bid $1,483,456.49

Alternate 2 AB-3 $234,675.00 $234,626.39 $234,759.75 No Bid $300,363.00

Base Bid + Alternate 2 $1,394,058.59 $1,181,029.08 $1,434,226.74 No Bid $1,607,049.99

Alternate 3 Crushed Concrete $136,962.00 $185,787.92 $207,617.25 $261,084.00 $256,935.00

Bill WengerAl VogtsJeff Wilson Steven Lawler

9229 E 37th St N, Suite 100

316-522-5100WCI Engineer's Estimate

Salina, KS  67402-1967

316-613-5100316-284-2801

Pavers Inc

505 Francis Ave / PO Box 1967

Cornejo & Sons LLC

2060 E Tulsa

785-825-6771

Vogts-Parga Construction

PO Box 67

North Newton, KS  67117

LaFarge North America

Wichita, KS  67226 Wichita, KS  67216

Bid Tab

South Kansas Avenue



Base Bid + Alternate 3 $1,296,345.59 $1,132,190.61 $1,407,084.24 $1,471,256.49 $1,563,621.99

Bid Bond -- Yes Yes Yes Yes

Bidders Qualifications Statement -- No Yes Yes Yes

Tabulation of Subcontractors -- No Yes Yes Yes

Acknowledgment of Addendum No. 1 -- Yes Yes Yes Yes

Acknowledgment of Addendum No. 2 -- Yes Yes Yes Yes

 not included w/bid, provided after.

Comm. waived requirement on this job

**  Discrepancy in extensions.

Corrected numbers shown  **

Bid Qualifications & Tab of Subs

Bid Tab

South Kansas Avenue


